
 ITEM 

NO.
DESCRIPTION AND PART NUMBER

LIFT 

STATION 

(LS) 

QTY GPM
TDH 

(FEET)
(HP)

VOLTAGE 

(V)
RPM FLA

PHASE 

(Ø)

LEAD TIME OF 

DELVERY FROM 
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PURCHASE 

ORDER

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

LEAD TIME OF 

DELVERY FROM 

ISSUE OF 

PURCHASE 

ORDER

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

1
Myers, 6VC250M4-43, Equipped with 35’ 

power cable, SS lifting bails
LS-2 2 25 460 1,750 38 3 6-8 WEEKS 9,370.00$          18,740.00$    -$        -$             

2 Myers , Myers model 6VC300M4-43, 

Equipped with 35’ power cable, SS lifting bails
LS-3 1 30 460 1,750 47 3 6-8 WEEKS 9,670.00$          9,670.00$      -$        -$             

3
Myers, 4R50M4-21, Equipped with 35’ power 

cable, SS lifting bails
LS-5 2 770 44 5 230 1,750 34 1 5-7 WEEKS 3,975.00$          7,950.00$      -$        -$             

4
Myers, 6VC600M4-43, Equipped with 35’ 

power cable, SS lifting bails
LS-6 1 60 460 1,750 79 3 6-8 WEEKS 10,410.00$        10,410.00$    -$        -$             

5
Myers, 6VC400M4-43, Equipped with 35’ 

power cable, SS lifting bails
LS-7 1 40 460 1,750 61 3 6-8 WEEKS 9,850.00$          9,850.00$      -$        -$             

6

Myers, 3RMW20DM4-21, Equipped with 30’ 

power cable, and 3” flanged horizontal 

discharge

LS-10 1 2 230 1,750 16 1 3-5 WEEKS 1,710.00$          1,710.00$      -$        -$             

7
Myers, 3MW20M4-21 Equipped with 30’ 

power cable and 3” (NPT) vertical discharge LS-11 1 2 230 1,750 12 1 3-5 WEEKS 1,570.00$          1,570.00$      -$        -$             

8 -$                    -$                -$        -$             

PREPARED BY: CAROLYN ALLEN-SMITH, PROCUREMENT SPECIALIST 

N.J. NUGENT & ASSOCIATES, INC. 

Note #1. Firm stated on Bid Price Sheet for 

Manufacturer Meyers "No Bid" .

N.J. NUGENT & ASSOCIATES, INC. 

-$                           

BID # FY 2017-2018-015                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                    

CITY OF HALLANDALE BEACH PURCHASE OF SEWER LIFT STATIONS PUMPS

TOTAL BID PRICE ITEMS 1-8

Freight/Delivery 

59,900.00$                             

MANUFACTURER                                                                                                                        

MEYERS
CUSTOM PUMP & CONTROLS, INC. 
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1

KSB, KRT F150-315/206XG-S Equipped with 

50’power cable, 6’ flanged H. Discharge, SS 

lifting bails
LS-14 3 966 42 24 230 1,160 61 3 17-22 WEEKS 10,140.00$  30,420.00$           -$          -$             

2 690.00$        2,070.00$             -$          -$             

PREPARED BY: CAROLYN ALLEN-SMITH, PROCUREMENT SPECIALIST 

N.J. NUGENT & ASSOCIATES, INC. 

Note #1. Firm stated on Bid Price Sheet for 

Manufacturer KSB "No Bid" .

F.J. NUGENT & ASSOCIATES, INC. 

-$                              

BID # FY 2017-2018-015                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                    

CITY OF HALLANDALE BEACH PURCHASE OF SEWER LIFT STATIONS PUMPS

Freight/Delivery 

TOTAL BID PRICE ITEMS 1-2 32,490.00$                              

MANUFACTURER                                                                                                                                

KSB
CUSTOM PUMP & CONTROLS, INC. 
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LIFT 
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1
Ebara, 150DLKFU6182 Equipped with 35’ 

power cable, SS lifting bails LS-9 1 1,310 45 25 208/230 1,800 3 $ $ 4-6 WEEKS 14,178.00$           14,178.00$       

2 $ $ $ -$                    

PREPARED BY: CAROLYN ALLEN-SMITH, PROCUREMENT SPECIALIST 

CUSTOM PUMP & CONTROLS, INC. 

Note #1. Firm stated on Bid Price Sheet for 

Manufacturer EBARA INERNATIONAL 

CORPORATION "No Bid" .

BID # FY 2017-2018-015                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                    

CITY OF HALLANDALE BEACH PURCHASE OF SEWER LIFT STATIONS PUMPS

F.J. NUGENT & ASSOCIATES, INC. 

14,178.00$                                    

Freight/Delivery 

TOTAL BID PRICE ITEMS 1-2 $

MANUFACTURER                                                                                                                                                                                    

EBARA INTERNATIONAL CORPORATION
CUSTOM PUMP & 

CONTROLS, INC.



 ITEM 

NO.
DESCRIPTION AND PART NUMBER

LIFT 

STATION 

(LS) 

QTY GPM
TDH 

(FEET)
(HP)

VOLTAGE 

(V)
RPM FLA

PHASE 

(Ø)

LEAD TIME OF 

DELVERY FROM 

ISSUE OF 

PURCHASE 

ORDER

UNIT 

PRICE

TOTAL 

PRICE

LEAD TIME OF 

DELVERY FROM 

ISSUE OF 

PURCHASE 

ORDER

UNIT 

PRICE

TOTAL 

PRICE

1

Gould, WS3032D4 (With:7" impeller, 4" 

discharge, 3" solids, 20' power cable) LS-15 1 440 20 3 230 1,725 14 3 $ $ $ $

2 $ $ $ $

PREPARED BY: CAROLYN ALLEN-SMITH, PROCUREMENT SPECIALIST 

CUSTOM PUMP & CONTROLS, INC. Note #1. Firm stated on Bid Price Sheet for 

Manufacturer Goulds Water Technology 

"No Bid" .

N.J. NUGENT & ASSOCIATES, INC. 

Note #2. Firm stated on Bid Price Sheet for 

Manufacturer Goulds Water Technology 

"No Bid" .

BID # FY 2017-2018-015                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                    

CITY OF HALLANDALE BEACH PURCHASE OF SEWER LIFT STATIONS PUMPS

N.J. NUGENT & ASSOCIATES, 

INC. 

$

Freight/Delivery 

TOTAL BID PRICE ITEMS 1-2 $

MANUFACTURER                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                         

GOULDS WATER TECHNOLOGY
CUSTOME PUMP & 

CONTROLS, INC. 



PREPARED BY: CAROLYN ALLEN-SMITH, PROCUREMENT SPECIALIST 

CUSTOM PUMP & CONTROLS, INC. 

Note #1. Firm's Total Bid Price is for Meyers and 

KSB pumps only. 

N.J. NUGENT & ASSOCIATES, INC. 

Note #2. Firm's Total Bid Price is for EBARA 

International Corporation pumps only.  

BID # FY 2017-2018-015                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                    

CITY OF HALLANDALE BEACH PURCHASE OF SEWER LIFT STATIONS PUMPS

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR MYERS ITEMS 1-8, KSB ITEMS 1-2, EBARA INTERNATIONAL CORPORATION 

ITEMS 1-2, GOULDS WATER TECHNOLOGY ITEMS 1-2. 
92,390.00$                                        

CUSTOM PUMP & CONTROLS, 

INC. 

N.J. NUGENT & ASSOCIATES, 

INC. 

14,178.00$                               


