

INVOICE

DATE:

March 24, 2017

TO:

Jennifer Merino, Esq.

City Attorney

c/o City of Hallandale Beach

400 South Federal Highway, Second Floor

Hallandale Beach, Florida 33309

MATTER:

SAO Investigation re Com. Michele Lazarow

City of Hallandale Beach

HOURS:

26.10 Hours

RATE:

\$450.00 / Hour

TOTAL DUE:

\$11,745.00

Please make check payable to: Law Offices of Brian Silber, P.A.

Michele Lazarow (SAO Investigation)

TIME SHEET

Wednesday, September 21, 2016 **1.50 Hours** • Initial consultation Thursday, September 22, 2016 **0.50 Hours** • Communicated with Discussed Friday, September 23, 2016 0.50 Hours • Communicated with Monday, September 26, 2016 2.0 Hours Reviewed • Conducted legal research Tuesday, September 27, 2016 **0.75 Hours** Reviewed Tuesday, October 18, 2016 **0.75 Hours** • Communicated with

Communicated briefly with
Sunday, October 23, 2016
3.5 Hours
• Met with
 Read and reviewed Read and reviewed Outlined .
Monday, October 24, 2016
3.0 Hours
 Reviewed Met with .
 Conference Attended Travelled to and from Communicated with
Wednesday, October 26, 2016
0.50 Hours
• Communicated with
<u> Thursday, October 27, 2016</u>
0.25 Hours
• Reviewed

Friday, October 28, 2016

2.75 Hours

Researched				
Researched				
Researched		Provide Plane (1999)		
Mapped				
Assembled	TO SOUTH STORY		Access to the contract of	
Drafted .				

Tue

0.50 Hours

• Communicated with

Wednesday, November 2, 2016

0.25 Hours

• Communicated with

Tuesday, November 15 - Monday, November 21, 2016

1.0 Hours

 Communicated with Communicated with

Wednesday, November 23, 2016

2.0 Hours

• Prepared for and attended • Communicated with

0.25 Hours	
• Communicated with	
Friday, December 16, 2016	
1.0 Hours	
• Communicated with Reviewed Reviewed	
Tuesday, December 27, 2016 – Thursday, December 29, 2016	
2.0 Hours	
Communicated with section 2. Reviewed section 2. Draft edited, and finalized section 2.	ed,
Friday, December 30, 2016	
2.50 Hours	
• Met with	
Wednesday, January 11, 2016	
0.50 Hours	
• Met with	
Thursday, January 19, 2016	
0.10 Hours	
 Communicated with Communicated with . 	

Thursday, December 15, 2016